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Introduction 

Since the 1970s, the archaeology of  the Lower Palaeolithic in 
the Levant has become an amalgam of  different approaches 
adding a plethora of  unequal pieces to the overall puzzle. The 
intention of  the present paper is to re-launch the discussion 
of  the Lower Palaeolithic in Syria and adjoining areas beyond 
traditional concepts. It is not the intention of  the authors to 
criticise different approaches of  our colleagues, but we try to 
overcome some traditional models that are in dire need of  revi-
sion. Therefore we refrain from extensive quotes as the aim is 
to launch constructive discussions and not to raise polemics. In 
this respect bibliographical referencing is limited to the neces-
sary minimum.

For its size, the Levant offers an unrivalled wealth of  Palaeo-
lithic sites of  all periods. A comparable density and variety of  
sites is quite unique on a global scale. The geographic setting, 
within the crossroads of  the Old World offers unique possi-
bilities for understanding early human behaviour on a broad 
database, permitting us to understand cultural variability in a 
limited space and over a very long time scale. Despite the po-
tential influences of  distant settlement areas into the Levant, 
but also vice versa, specific local traditions can be identified 
throughout its history. It is beyond this paper to go into the 
details of  influences from outside the Levant and their cultural 
impact on neighbouring areas. Ideas and technological con-
cepts obviously went back and forth, making the Levant a kind 
of  turntable. It was not the melting pot one could expect, but 
kept throughout the ages a strong and proper cultural identity.

Traditionally the Levantine Palaeolithic has been perceived in 
a Eurocentric conception. Since the beginning of  Palaeolithic 
archaeology along the eastern Mediterranean, beginning in the 
late nineteenth century, Europe was undeniably the centre for 
prehistoric research where the basic concepts of  Old Stone 
Age archaeology and Quaternary geology were developed. Re-
searchers working in the Levant relied on their European ex-
perience to unravel the Levantine Palaeolithic. Many labels and 
affiliations established at that time still cling to the respective 
materials today. Qualitative arguments were more important 
than quantitative evidence. In this manner, statistically ques-
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tionable inventories became keystones, as indices of  artefact 
categories permitted comparison and classification. In many 
cases, indices were computed against basic statistical rules. Also 
clear numerical inventories are only available for a few select-
ed sites, impeding a reasonable reassessment of  the corpus in 
question. Furthermore the political situation in the second half  
of  the twentieth century restricted scientific co-operation, as 
international boundaries became a considerable obstacle for re-
search. Exchange was only possible through publications and 
informal personal contacts. Therefore local schools prevailed 
on either side of  the political divide, going their separate ways. 
This may explain to a certain extent the partitioned approaches 
for the Palaeolithic of  the Levant. 

History of  research

Despite a longstanding tradition of  Palaeolithic research since 
the end of  the nineteenth century in what was then Ottoman 
Syria, the first discoveries of  Lower Palaeolithic sites within to-
day’s boundaries date back to the year 1900 (Morgan 1927). Re-
search on the Lower Palaeolithic resumed in the 1930s (Burkhal-
ter 1933). In the same period, from 1931 to 1933, Alfred Rust 
conducted his prestigious excavations at Yabrud (Rust 1950) 
laying an important base for further investigations. Another 
breakthrough was van Liere’s (1961) studies on the Quaternary 
of  Syria, which permitted the discovery and subsequent exca-
vations of  the Latamne sites (Modderman 1964; Clark 1966). 
These efforts were resumed in the mid 1970s by an interdisci-
plinary team of  prehistorians and geomorphologists under the 
auspices of  the French CNRS. The team of  F. Hours, L. Co-
peland, P. Sanlalaville, J. Besançon and S. Muhesen established 
most of  what is known today about Lower Palaeolithic sites in 
Syria. Within a rather short time period, a number of  carefully 
selected regions were investigated: in 1976 the Nahr el Kebir 
near Lattakia (Sanlaville 1979), in 1977 the Middle Orontes val-
ley (Besançon et al. 1993), in 1978 the area around Raqqa on the 
Euphrates (Copeland 2004), in 1979 the Menbij sector, again 
on the Euphrates (Copeland 2004) and in 1980 the desert area 
around El Kowm (Besançon et al. 1981). In later years, these 
survey were completed in 1989 with the area around Tartous 
on the Mediterreanean coast (Besançon et al. 1994). In conse-
quence of  those screenings, a number of  Acheulean sites were 
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excavated: in 1979 and 1981 Gharmachi Ib (Muhesen 1985), 
from 1989 to 2003 Nadaouiyeh Aïn Askar (Jagher 2011), from 
1996 to 1998 El Meirah (Boëda et al. 2004), and soundings were 
carried out 1989 in Juwal Aïn Zarqa and in 1991 in Qdeïr Aïn 
Ojbeh by J.-M. Le Tensorer and S. Muhesen.

The results of  these surveys were published with unequal inter-
vals between field work and publication for different reasons, 
amongst them, the premature death in 1987 of  Francis Hours, 
the mastermind and moving spirit of  this research group. A fi-
nal summary, reassessing all these results, has never been edited. 
However, results were included in interim syntheses in expecta-
tion of  the concluding publications. The current appreciation of  
the Lower Palaeolithic in Syria has remained a patchwork, without 
later synthesis or revision. The understanding of  the fundamen-
tal argumentation through existing publications is ambiguous.

Today, more than a generation later, those results can be seen 
in a different light. The spirit and background of  that time (i.e. 
the mid 1970s) has to be recalled in order to understand the 
implications of  this research. Geomorphological studies as a 

reference for the relative age of  the archaeological materials 
were based on the classical quadrinomial concept of  the Pleis-
tocene in the sense of  Penck and Brückner (1909). With such 
an approach, mapping of  fluviatile terraces was simplified, but 
had a limited chronological resolution. On the other hand, ar-
chaeologists depended at that time on the "short chronology" 
presuming, the end of  the Acheulean to be in the final stages of  
the "Riss-glaciation" (i.e. Marine Isotope Stage 6) with a model 
age at that time of  around 150,000 years BP (actual models now 
put the same transition around 350,000 years). Furthermore, 
in keeping with the mainstream in archaeology, the perception 
of  cultural development depended on a strongly evolutionary 
conception, going progressively from primitive to elaborate 
tools and from basic to complex technologies. The fundamen-
tal approach was that archaeological materials can be classi-
fied in their chronological order along these guidelines. In that 
spirit, a complex framework of  cultural evolution, particularly 
for the late Acheulean, was devised. With growing experience 
not only was the relative chronological scheme refined, but also 
contemporaneous regional groups were defined. In many cases 
cultural attributions based on limited collections and observa-

Figure 1 - Map of  Syria with location of  main Palaeolithic surveys or investigations with a strong focus on that period. 
Bold numerals stand for the number of  sites with hand axes n>20; normal typography indicates the number of  sites 
with hand axes.
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tions were substantiated by cross-referencing with other sites. 
Once labelled, sites remained in the general discussion without 
questioning their value for further synthesis. Most of  all, the 
system lacked a sound chronological control as all these disco
veries were either surface discoveries or represented only one 
single phase site.

With the excavations at Nadaouiyeh Aïn Askar, the traditional 
model was seriously challenged. The complex stratigraphy of  
that site eventually revealed seven distinct Acheulean facies in a 
definite chronological sequence (Jagher 2011). Against expecta-
tions, the most elaborate and standardised hand axes turned out 
to be the oldest and the expected "progressive artefact associa-
tions" were not substantiated at all. Against this evidence the 
conventional understanding of  the Syrian Acheulean needs a 
profound revision (fig. 2).

Out of  Africa and the beginnings of  hand axes. 

Hand axes are one of  the "guide fossils" for the "out of  Africa" 
dispersal of  early hominids. In fact the oldest known hand axes 
appear about 1.6 million years ago in Eastern Africa (e.g. As-
faw et al. 1992; Isaac & Isaac 1997; de Lumley & Beyene 2004). 
However, in almost all of  these sites, the hand axe is a very rare 
instrument. Basically these materials are a in strong tradition 
with earlier core and flake industries. The very low numbers 
clearly show that hand axes had a minor meaning for their ma
kers. This is also the case for the early sites in the Levant,such 
as Ubeidiya and El Kowm (Le Tensorer et al. 2011). We may ask, 
provocatively, but why did hand axes not take a stronger hold in 
the early African Acheulean for more than half  a million years 
until they became a dominating feature?

In a purely evolutionary concept, one brilliant mind would have 
been responsible for the invention of  this icon of  the Lower 
Palaeolithic. Contrary to biological evolution, in cultural history 
a multiple origin in the sense of  congruent inventions leading 
to the same solution is possible and no contradiction, but quite 
the reality. The manipulation of  stone material obeys the same 
universal physical laws, permitting just a limited technological 
repertoire. In later periods of  prehistory, congruent evolutions 
are generally accepted (e.g. blade technologies, foliated tools 
and so on). Why could that not happen also in earlier periods? 
It has to be kept in mind that the invention of  the hand axe, 
a quite generic tool in its basic concept, needed neither par-
ticular technical skills nor superior cognitive capacities beyond 
the possibilities of  the time. Basically, hominids already out of  
Africa were not much duller than their cousins next out of  the 
cradle of  humankind. In such an environment a multiple origin 
of  the hand axe is also conceivable. 

In fact, the archaeological evidence is undisputable: the oldest 
stone tools are known from Eastern Africa, from where they 
spread within a surprisingly short period around the Old World. 
But is that sufficient to affiliate all further "big inventions" from 
the area of  origin? If  so, East Africa should have been at the 
height of  technological invention (at least concerning lithic tech-
nologies), a worldwide "leadership" that is not confirmed by the 
archaeological evidence. Hence a multi-regional approach is as 
possible as an exclusively African provenance for hand axes. In 

a purely evolutionary approach, the earliest appearance would 
designate the origins, but human culture is not submitted to 
biological laws. Anachronisms and convergent development are 
both possible and are no contradiction, as human behaviour is 
complex and unpredictable.

Nomenclature 

Lower Palaeolithic: the core and flakes traditions

The concept of  the "Lower Palaeolithic", issued from the clas-
sical tripartite classification and terminology of  the nineteenth 
century (de Mortillet 1883), however it comprises more than 
85% of  human history. This modest term combines quite dif-
ferent cultures and traditions in a huge geographic range du
ring an extremely long period. Lithic traditions changed slowly 
from the original core and flakes concepts. Most of  these early 
technologies kept their archaic aspect over a long time. Despite 
archaeologists’ concepts, changes were neither universal nor 
synchronous or in a consequent progression. Instead of  accu-
rate observations, scholars relay rather on academic concepts 
adopted by the scientific community. A classical example in this 
domain for the Lower Palaeolithic is the question of  mode 1 
and mode 2 (Clark 1969) which is still vigorous today. There is 
often confusion between biological evolution and cultural his-
tory that only share a common time axis. However, culture is 
not a biological constant, but the product of  a multitude of  
stimuli from nature and human imagination slowing or acceler-
ating cultural change independent of  time and space. 

The reasoning that cultural development and biological evolu-
tion are strongly interconnected is a widespread, but never re-

Figure 2 - Confrontation the conventional chronology of  the 
Syrian Upper Acheulean to the sequence present in the Nadaouiyeh 
stratigraphy.
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ally confirmed, concept, with strong ties between hominid taxa 
and the evolutionary level of  stone tools. However, the fossil 
evidence, including the Levant, is ambiguous. It may support 
such models: e.g. the Nadaouiyeh hominid shows more ana-
tomical affinities to its East Asian cousins than to its African 
or European contemporaries (Le Tensorer et al. 1997; Jagher 
et al. 1997), however, the material culture is entirely oriented 
to hand axes, that are nearly completely benign to the biologi-
cal counterparts. Also the Levantine Neanderthals, contrary 
to their European brothers, utterly abandoned the hand axe in 
their cultural repertoire.

In conventional terminology, the Lower Palaeolithic comprises 
the archaic lithic traditions, i.e. the core and flakes technological 
complexes in an early stage, and the hand axe civilisation is la-
belled as Acheulean in a more recent phase. The former are dif-
ficult to characterise, especially in small collections, as diagnos-
tic tools are rare. These early archaic industries, distinguished 
by generic tools and basic technologies, constrict detailed clas-
sifications. With the appearance of  hand axes, discoveries with 
this index are called Acheulean. This term, suggesting a shared 
identity indeed encompasses quite different cultural expressions 
e.g. the Ubeidiya inventories, the Gesher-Latamne complex or 
the highly elaborated hand axes from Nadaouiyeh, just to cite a 
few Levantine examples.

A short digression on the label "Acheulean"

In archaeology, the term "Acheulean" comprises a plethora of  
meanings, covering a wide range of  applications; it can be a 
purely chronological indication (in a wider or a closer sense) 
implying a concise time span or not, it can be a technological 
specification, it may allude to cultural entities in a generic or 
general definition, it can be only a particular cultural trait such 
as specific artefact categories (i.e., hand axes), it may hint at the 
cognitive capacities of  their makers, it may allude to a particular 
population group or be used in a taxonomic sense, or simply as 
a way of  life. In short, it is an all- purpose expression wherever 
hand axes are involved. The attribute "Acheulean" was even gi
ven to post-Acheulean industries evoking Acheulean traditions 
such as "Acheulo-Yabrudian" or "Moustero-Acheulean", just as 
examples from the Levant.

Even if  the hand axe is the icon of  the Acheulean and to some 
extent of  the Lower Palaeolithic, rarely is the question asked 
how important they really were to their makers. Instead of  clear 
numbers, frequencies are given in terms such as an "elevated 
percentage" and so on. But what is the value of  such expres-
sions? In a context of  few, "some" may be already "a lot". It 
is somewhat like the question of  how many swallows make a 
summer, as the simple definition, hand axes equal Acheulean, 
falls short of  the reality. With such lax handling, the term loses 
a good deal of  its significance and easily produces misunder-
standings, if  no specifications or further definitions are given 
about the particular meaning of  the concept.

This disparate situation was already criticised by Paola Villa in 
1983: "We use the term 'Acheulian' to cover a too-long and too-
little-known phase of  human prehistory. It is not a master-key 
to the past; it is a trap for unpatterned data, old collections, and 

stray finds. Like a Mother Goddess, the Acheulian embraces a 
multitude of  orphans. Such a wide label has been useful in the 
past, expressing a need for synthetic organization of  data above 
fragmented antiquarian interests. It is now an ambiguous gen-
eralization which is being used to suggest cultural relationships 
where only similarities of  technological level should be implied" 
(Villa 1983:23). To this very day, there is little to be added to 
that statement.

Quantitative versus qualitative approach 

In the past, the qualitative typological approach to Palaeolithic 
cultures was much favoured by archaeologists as the direct com-
parison between sites was a generally approved method. The 
quantitative notion was neglected to a large extent, or gener-
ally reduced to expressions like "elevated" or "low percentage", 
but rarely presenting the numeric base. This procedure made it 
possible to include small samples in a wider discussion without 
difficulties and permitted one to integrate almost every site into 
a synthesis. 

In this respect, the Nadaouiyeh Aïn Askar excavations clear-
ly unveiled the pit-falls of  the just qualitative estimation of  
Acheulean inventories. This site produced hand axes in such 
numbers that serious statistical analysis became possible (Jag-
her 2000, 2005). Without going into details here, a number of  
mathematical and empirical tests was carried out do determine 
the minimal size for a representative sample. In order to make a 
sound statement about a hand axe inventory concerning formal 
aspects (typology, morphometry, technology etc.), and potential 
comparisons with other sites, about 50 individuals are necessary 
at least. In cases of  a strong heteromorphy or a broader metrical 
variance this may be considerably higher. As a rule of  thumb, 
with 75 individuals, the chances are fair for a serious assess-
ment of  a material as statistical evaluation becomes reproduc-
ible within a reasonable range. 

Empirical experience revealed that for entities with an excep-
tionally good standardization of  shapes, samples of  more than 
two dozen may give a fair idea in general. This applies to highly 
elaborated techniques and, on the other hand, for extremely ba-
sic execution, i.e. inventories where strict uniformity strikes the 
eye immediately. Everything else needs a much broader base, 
such as stated above, to measure the variability.

The rather high number of  hand axes necessary for an assess-
ment has to be seen against the background that each hand axe 
is individually manufactured on a random blank. Hence accurate 
reproduction is only possible with a limited potential. Currently 
applied typological classifications and differentiations clearly 
transgress the feasibilities of  the makers. The existing typolo-
gies, in fact, are academic concepts, feigning neat classifications 
that fall short of  the intentions of  the original makers. 

Chronological framework

Indirect observations, such as the Dmanissi discoveries, hint 
at a long human history in the Levant. The earliest well con-
firmed human presence in the Levant dates back about 1.6 mil-
lion years in the site of  Ubeidiya in Israel (Belmaker 2006:12). 
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They belong to an archaic Palaeolithic dominated by a core and 
flake technology comparable to the Oldowan of  eastern Africa. 
Analogous industries in Syria are known from Hummal and Aïn 
al Fil (Le Tensorer 2009). The presence of  hand axes in some 
of  the layers in Ubeidiya (and also in Hummal) earned this site 
the label "Acheulean". The frequency of  hand axes is usually 
low throughout the Ubeydia levels, with a few exceptions. The 
basic aspect of  the industry is archaic and clearly dominated by 
core tools (choppers, spheroids etc.) and retouched flakes. As 
stated above, the generic designation Acheulean is not helpful. 
In all, hand axes make up a mere 7% of  the shaped tools all over 
the site (Bar-Yosef  & Goren-Inbar 1993). For the Syrian sites 
of  the same period the statistical base impedes further consi
derations beyond a descriptive level (Wegmüller 2011). The la-
bel Oldowan is as inapplicable for the presence of  hand axes 
as is Acheulean for their scarcity. The term Proto-Acheulean 
better describes the situation. This is consistent with the first 
hand axe traditions in eastern Africa, where hand axes do only 
occasionally exceed more than 10% of  the shaped tools.

The situation changes clearly with the appearance of  the "middle 
Acheulean" in the conventional terminology. Existing definitions 
clearly picture this entity in the Levant with its classical sites of  
Gesher Benot Yaakov and Latamne and associated discoveries. 
Hand axes and assorted artefacts are the dominant tools in this 
group, presenting a standardised style of  shaping the hand axes 
which are consistently of  respectable size. At least the Gesher 
cleavers display a strong African influence. How far this applies 
to the whole group has yet to be demonstrated. In the following, 
we name this group the Levantine Lower Acheulean (i.e. what 
is traditionally the Middle Acheulean or Acheuléen moyen) as 
the historical tripartite system should be abandoned for being 
unfounded. The chronology of  the Levantine Lower Acheulean 
is subject to discussion. At Gesher it clearly dates around 780 ka 
(Goren-Inbar et al. 2000). Recent palaeontological estimations 
suggest an even older age for Latamne, possibly around 1 ma 
(Bar-Yosef  & Belmaker 2010). The end of  the Levantine Lower 
Acheulean can tentatively be placed around 600 ka (see below).

Consistently for the classical Acheulean in the Bilad As Sham, 
the term Levantine Upper Acheulean is proposed. The prefix 
Levantine is added in order to define clearly the separation 
from other Acheulean groups. The beginnings of  the Levan-
tine Upper Acheulean are subject to speculation. However, a 
progressive age model for the Nadaouiyeh Aïn Askar site sug-
gests an age of  about 550 ka for the oldest levels which clearly 
belong to an "upper Acheulean". Given that age, and the strik-
ing conceptual difference from the preceding Levantine Lower 
Acheulean, the advent of  the Levantine Upper Acheulean can 
be placed around 600 ka. Its end coincides with the advent of  
the Yabrudian complex about 350 ka ago based on a conserva-
tive interpretation of  the evidence from Tabun and Qesem cave 
(Mercier et al. 2003, Gopher et al. 2010).

The transition to the Yabrudian complex is drastic with pro-
found replacements in the tool set concerning formal and tech-
nological aspects. In fact the change to the Yabrudian complex 
is much more radical than that from the Lower to the Upper 
Acheulean, which was more a question of  style than technologi-
cal concepts. The enduring presence of  hand axes during the 

Yabrudian complex must not be regarded as proof  of  a strict 
Acheulean origin in the same reasoning as the Proto-Acheu-
lean is not forcibly the direct ancestor of  the Lower Acheulean. 
Their alignment along the timeline suggests a perfect although 
sketchy succession. But this is only one of  several possible ex-
planations and without further arguments one should be careful 
with premature interpretations. 

"Acheulean" sites in Syria 

A survey of  published data reported the occurrence of  an as-
tonishing 238 reputedly Acheulean locations in Syria including 
in some cases sites with several layers (tab. 1). For 41 places 
(i.e., 17%), it is only known that hand axes were found, but no 
precise numbers are given. The vast majority of  the remain-
der consist of  just a few hand axes and in general only some 
sparse other findings, with the bifaces being the only diagnostic 
object(s). More than half  of  the claimed Acheulean discoveries 
produced less than half  a dozen hand axes and from 76% of  
the so called "Acheulean" sites less than one dozen of  han-
daxes were recovered. Observations  with one to two dozens of  
handaxes were made only at 9 places. Only 34 sites with a clear 
hand axe component, i.e. more than two dozens of  bifaces, are 
present. Half  of  them have been excavated, the remaining 17 
locations are known through surface collections. Complete in-
ventories including precise numbers hand axes, retouched flake 
and core tools (i.e. choppers, chopping-tools and associated ar-
tefacts) are available for 113 sites (i.e. 47%). For the remainder 
information is incomplete.

The tendency of  incomplete data and small numbers of  ar-
tefacts is representative for the whole Levant, where isolated 
discoveries of  hand axes were readily attributed to the "Acheu-
lean". It has to be noted that nearly all of  all these discoveries 
are surface collections with little information about the taphono
mic context of  these sites. During surface surveys, hand axes are 
readily spotted and recognised as such even when badly eroded 
(Jagher 2011). The associated débitage is rarely given the same 
attention. Furthermore, surface sites tend to be palimpsests of  
different occupations. In such a case, hand axes are usually de-
tached from the remainder and attributed to the Acheulean as 
alleged guide fossils for this period. 

Hand axes in the Post-Acheulean cultural entities of  the Near 
East are much less frequent than in the preceding periods. When 
comparing the total number of  hand axes clearly associated with 
the Acheulean and the ones attributed to the Post-Acheulean 
from excavated or systematically surveyed sites throughout the 
Levant, there is a chance of  four to one that a hand axe actu-
ally is Acheulean. However, it is doubtful if  this simple relation 
can be attributed to isolated discoveries. Isolated discoveries of  
handaxes, that is sites with less than a dozen handaxes (i.e. 76% 
of  the originally claimed discoveries), have to be considered as 
minor sites with an indicative value only. Their significance for 
landscape archaeology has yet to be confirmed.

The Early Palaeolithic in Syria 

Early industries discovered within very old Pleistocene forma-
tions attributed to the Qm III and Qf  IV stages, show quite 
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Table 1 - Inventory of  hand axe sites in Syria: -- no data; • presence confirmed but no numbers available.
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Table 1 - (continued): Inventory of  hand axe sites in Syria: -- no data; • presence confirmed but no numbers available.
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Table 1 - (continued): Inventory of  hand axe sites in Syria: -- no data; 
• presence confirmed but no numbers available.

a wide distribution throughout Syria from the Mediterranean 
coast (Nahr el Kebir), along the Orontes river probably also in 
the Euphrates valley. Beyond their relative age, dating clearly 
to the Lower Pleistocene, these discoveries remain difficult to 
characterise, as the census of  artefacts in most cases is low and 
diagnostic objects are rare. Nearly all these materials elude a 
precise archaeological appreciation. The differentiation between 
mode 1 and mode 2 as it has been proposed in the past, is dif-
ficult to maintain given the low statistical base of  most Syrian 
sites. However, hand axes made in an archaic style are clearly 
represented at several of  these sites (e.g. Cheikh Mohammed, 
Sitt Markho, Mahardé 2, Fidio II, Nahr El Kebir). Most of  the 
other sites do no more permit than the conclusion of  an undis-
putable early human presence. 

Nevertheless these discoveries demonstrate an early and wide-
spread human occupation. Previously proposed age estimations 
of  these sites have to be handled with care, as these were model 
ages issued with chronological concepts other than those in 
use today (i.e. the quadrinomial Quaternary). Also their relative 
contemporaneity is delicate to establish as the correlation of  the 
Quaternary formations is based on geomorphological observa-
tions that are difficult to correlate directly from one river system 
to the next. Nevertheless, these early sites reflect a widespread 
human presence during the early Pleistocene at least along the 
major river systems. The data available for most are too sparse 
to draw a detailed picture. However, they clearly demonstrate 
the scientific potential for further investigations. 

Recent discoveries in the El Kowm area also revealed significant 
early settlement activities in the central Syrian Desert Steppe (Le 
Tensorer et al. 2011). The stratified sites of  Hummal and Aïn al 
Fil produced substantial materials, permitting a better diagnosis 
of  these industries (Wegmüller 2011). Besides the archaic aspect 
of  the lithics, preliminary datings and palaeontological observa-
tions confirm their great antiquity which can be estimated to be 
as old as Ubeidiya. The geographical settings of  these two sites, 
far from ecologically favoured areas, point clearly to a much more 
widespread human occupation in the Levant during that time and 
a much more versatile behaviour than was previously thought. 

In addition to a core and flake technology the Hummal site 
produced a very small number of  hand axes featuring a quite 
progressive style of  manufacture for such ancient tools. These 
hand axes are made in a first-grade flint material, contrary to 
their rather coarse counterparts from Ubeidiya, In fact, the 
quality of  the raw materials is often underestimated, as indus-
tries using poor raw materials easily develop an archaic aspect. 

The Acheulean 

The Levantine Acheulean is clearly dived into two distinct pe
riods. The quality of  manufacture of  the hand axes clearly sepa-
rates the older from the younger phase. Basically both focus on 
the façonnage for making their tools. Retouched flakes are rare 
in either stage. In fact hand axes are the dominant type among 
shaped artefacts. In their fundamental essence, the older and 
younger Acheulean are very similar and share the same con-
cepts despite striking differences in the appearance of  their 
hand axes.
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Levantine Lower Acheulean

The Levantine Lower Acheulean (formerly the Acheuléen moyen) 
is the first real hand axe tradition in the Bilad Ash Sham. It is 
readily recognised even in rather small samples by the style of  
manufacture of  hand axes and their respectable size. Hand axes 
and associated tools are abundant. An African influence is pre
sent in the numerous typical cleavers on huge flakes made of  
basalt in Gesher Benot Yaakov (alias Gisr Banat Yaqub). Farther 
north this feature completely disappears from the archaeologi-
cal evidence. Either this is a chronological phenomenon or due 
to the available raw materials. In the northern sites hand axes 
are made exclusively of  flint nodules preventing the production 
of  large flakes suitable for making cleavers.

The Levantine Lower Acheulean is quite consistent in its style 
of  manufacturing hand axes all over its distribution area, reach-
ing from Israel into Turkey and from the coast deep into the 
desert steppes of  the interior. From Syria quite a number of  
sites are known from that period. The characteristic traits of  
Lower Acheulean hand axes in the past have been overestima
ted and the status of  a number of  supposedly Levantine Lower 
Acheulean sites has to be revised before confirmation. 

By their excellent diagnostics Lower Acheulean hand axes can be 
ascertained even when present in quite small numbers. Against 
the requirements postulated above, Lower Acheulean sites can 
be identified with certainty with as few as a dozen hand axes. 
On that basis, seven sites can be certainly attributed to the Le-
vantine Lower Acheulean (e.g. Latamne [Clark 1966; Copeland 
et al. 1993], Meirah [Boëda et al. 2004], Jabal Jibtaa [Copeland & 
Hours 1979:62], Berzine [Copeland & Hours 1979:65], Khéllalé 
4 [Copeland & Hours 1979, 1993] Nad-X [Jagher 2004], with a 
number of  candidates needing further confirmation.

Compared with the subsequent Levantine Upper Acheulean the 
earlier phase remains poorly known. So far only two sites of  the 
Levantine Lower Acheulean, Latamne and Mheira (El Kowm 
area), have been excavated in Syria (Moddermann 1964; Clark 
1966; Boëda et al. 2004). 

The concept of  regional differentiations proposed for the Le-
vantine Lower Palaeolithic arose from an overestimation of  
sites with a limited number of  artefacts. Wide variations are 
an inherent phenomenon among small samples and are a natu-
ral statistical effect. Human perception values differences more 
than common traits, a biological constant of  our species, to 
which also scientists are subject. Therefore, traditional concepts 
based on small numerical evidence have to be considered with 
care. This goes particularly for the idea of  a Lower Acheulean 
lacking hand axes, which was suggested on the basis of  very 
small collections retrieved in situ from middle Pleistocene flu-
vial deposits of  the Orontes and Euphrates. With less than 52 
artefacts retrieved per site, as it is the case for all these claims, a 
definite statement is difficult.
 
Levantine Upper Acheulean

The Levantine Upper Acheulean presents a sharp break with 
the Levantine Lower Acheulean in the manufacture of  its hand 

axes, which become smaller and much more elaborate. Albeit 
sizes clearly diminish (fig. 3) and volumes shrink in favour of  
thin sections, the concept of  core tools, including not only clas-
sical hand axes but also lesser forms such as pièces bifaciales 
Façonnage is the central theme in these materials, with only an 
intermittend ans unsystematic flake production. Consequently, 
flake tools are rare. It is striking that in many sites denticulates 
and notches are the most common flake tools. A personal reas-
sessment of  some of  these materials showed the presence of  
natural edge damage to a certain degree. Hence, the published 
data reflects an overestimation of  human activity over natural 
phenomena. 

The same goes for the claims of  complex flake technologies (i.e., 
Levallois). A short reappraisal of  the so-called Defaian sites, 
known for the apparent coexistence of  hand axes and Levallois 
débitage, clearly revealed a palimpsest situation. The theory of  
an evolution from hand axe technologies to Levallois débitage 
cannot be supported with the Syrian evidence. The presence of  
possible Levallois flakes in Acheulean contexts is rather to be 
seen in the manufacturing waste of  hand axes than in a proper 
production (Copeland 1995). Until the emergence of  the Leval-
lois concept in the Levant as a stable production scheme can be 
established, one has to wait for the end of  the Yabrudian peri-
od. Consequently Acheulean hand axes can hardly be a stimulus 
in the invention of  that specific technique. Albeit the surface 
of  a Levallois core and the face of  a hand axe present some 
morphological affinities, the maintenance and exploitation of  
the volume is submitted to completely different constraints, 
the most prominent being that hand axes are bifacial tools. Le
vallois-like flakes in an Acheulean context are a morphological 
congruence suggesting inherence where there is none.

Compared with the Lower Acheulean, the subsequent period 
shows an astonishing proliferation of  sites almost by a factor of  
eight, based on the same scale as for the Lower Acheulean (i.e. 
a minimal number of  a dozen hand axes). With such a rich le
gacy, stylistic variation becomes clearly discernible among sites 
of  the Upper Acheulean. In an earlier attempt this observation 
was structured along a typo-chronological conception including 

Figure 3 - Variation of  mean length of  hand axes. Only sites with at 
least 20 measurements are considered.
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regional divisions, especially in the final stages. Diversification 
within the late Acheulean is not only present in Syria, but is an 
inherent trait of  the whole Levantine Upper Acheulean. A key 
site for understanding the noticed variability is Nadaouiyeh Aïn 
Askar, with seven distinct facies of  the Upper Acheulean (Jagh-
er 2011). Changes occurred swiftly in many cases within a surpri
singly short period. These mutations concern a multitude of  as-
pects such as the style of  manufacture or formal standardisation 
of  hand axes, the repertoire of  shapes, the sense of  symmetry 
or the neglect of  any of  standardisation and the importance 
of  small bifacial tools. All these elements appear and vanish 
at random along the time axis and defy any logical succession. 
This could be the key to why previous attempts at a chrono-
typological structuring of  the Levantine Upper Acheulean have 
failed. By its nature, the Nadaouiyeh stratigraphy is incomplete, 
with substantial hiatuses leaving room for imagination. In fact 
the neighbouring sites of  Qdeïr Aïn Ojbeh and Juwal Aïn Zarqa 
elude a clear classification according to the Nadaouiyeh scheme, 
despite a good geo-chronological control among the three sites 
and rich assemblages of  the former two. 
 
Other Syrian sites of  the Upper Acheulean, such as Muqaa El 
Hami, Qara Yaqub, Jrabiat 6a & 6b, Roudo and Ard Hamed, 
which withstand a clear attribution to the Nadouiyan scheme. 
However, the discoveries of  Gharmachi Ib feature a strong af-
finity with the facies Nadaouiyeh-B (Nad-B). Beyond the Syrian 
context, the Nadaouiyeh observations are recognisable in Um 
Qatafa on the West Bank (Neuville 1931, 1951), presenting a 
close homology between layer E1 to Nad-E, D2 to Nad-D and 
Da to Nad-B. In Azraq (Jordan), particularly at Aïn Soda, a very 
similar industry to the facies Nad-D was discovered (Rollef-
son et al. 1997). Both sites share a strong presence of  specific 
cleaver-like hand axes (Azraq cleavers), made with a uni- or bi-
facial single or multiple tranchet blow on ovate hand axes with a 
clearly offset base from sub-parallel or slightly convergent sides. 
Both sites share a keen sense for a refined style in execution 
and a comparable spectrum of  shapes of  hand axes. Tranchet-
blow cleavers should not be confused with the true (African) 
cleavers, as they are derived by a secondary modification from 
true hand axes (Jagher 2011). Comparable tools are rare in the 
other Levantine Upper Acheulean but are occasionally reported 
in younger periods (Matskevich 2006).

Despite the heterogeneity of  the Levantine Upper Acheulean, 
these observations show a well established cultural versatility 
in a time when cultural development was thought to be slug-
gish and little inspired. In fact the Levantine Upper Acheulean, 
despite its fixation on the façonnage technique and strong prefe
rence of  hand axes, was a most dynamic culture with a strong 
evolutionary momentum. The hand axe was indeed a leitmotif, 
but not the only aspect of  that culture with a surprising contrast 
of  tradition and innovation.

The Post-Acheulean – the end of  the hand axe 
era in the Levant

The question of  the end of  the lower Palaeolithic is somewhat 
controversial: the issue is whether the Yabrudian is Lower or 
Middle Palaeolithic. If  we consider only the hand axes, there is 
a certain "Acheulean" element present to some extent. From a 

qualitative approach there is no question about that. However, 
the proportion of  hand axes is by far smaller than in the Upper 
Acheulean. The concept of  façonnage definitely has a different 
condition if  the quantitative aspect is considered. In fact, the 
Yabrudian clearly prefers the débitage approach to produce the 
supports for its tools, whereas the façonnage is merely an acces-
sory phenomenon clearly of  lesser importance than in previous 
periods. 

The change between the Levantine Upper Acheulean and the 
Yabrudian is profound. Why the Upper Acheulean disappeared 
after a successful and long lasting proliferation in all regions of  
the Levant is unclear. Climatic change is probably not the only 
culprit (in fact there is a marked rise of  global temperatures be-
tween 340 and 330 ka, at the limit of  MIS 10 and 9). However, 
the Upper Acheulean went through several and severe climate 
changes during its existence without much effect. Whether the 
Acheulean just faded away, giving way to new settlers, or if  an 
inherent momentum triggered this change or was an influence 
from neighbouring populations, is open to debate.

In any case the Yabrudian features few if  any common traits 
with the Upper Acheulean. Hand axes, much less popular than 
before, are the only potential link. However, they differ in size 
from the earlier ones and show different forms that are rare 
or unfamiliar in preceding cultures (fig. 4). The concepts of  
an "Acheulo-Yabrudian" emanated from the Yabrud excava-
tions, where levels with higher and lower percentages of  hand 
axes are interstratified (Rust 1950; Bordes 1955). Conspicu-
ously layers with the prefix "Acheulo" are the ones that pro-
duced only small quantities of  artefacts, hence an assessment 
on a weak statistical base. In fact such short inventories are 
difficult to estimate, as their composition is rather fortuitous 
and barely reflects the intentions of  their makers. Ultimately 
the Yabrudian is a less "Acheulean" entity than one may think, 
it is not the exceptions that make the definitions, but it is the 
mainstream that counts. In this case it is the abandonment 
of  façonnage as the central theme in favour of  débitage and 
retouched flakes.

Figure 4 - Proportion of  hand axes in relation to retouched flakes, 
dark grey: Acheulean sites (n=28), light grey; post-Acheulean sites 
(n=48). Only sites with more than 100 pieces are considered.
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The question of  the "Tayacian"

While dealing with the Lower Palaeolithic in the Levant inevi-
table one comes across the "Tayacian". The term "Tayacian" 
was first introduced into the Levant by Dorothy Garrod during 
her Tabun excavations (Garrod & Bate 1937). Since its initial 
definition in the early 1930s (Breuil 1932), its assessment has 
proved difficult. With the years the "Tayacian" became a kind 
of  receptacle of  the same kind as has been outlined in this pa-
per for the Acheulean (see chapter A schort digression on the Label 
"Acheulean"), for classifying poorly defined lithic collections de-
void of  (or poor in) characteristic artefacts combined with a ge-
neric débitage. The lack of  apparent character is the connective 
peculiarity of  these materials. But is that enough to establish a 
stringent cultural link between respective sites?

Considering the chronological situation of  reportedly "Taya-
cian" sites in the Levant, the situation remains blurred. At Um 
Qatafa the "Tayacian" predates a Levantine Upper Acheulean. 
Recent investigations of  the lower part of  the Tabun strati
graphy challenge the label "Acheulean" for unit XIV or layer F. 
In fact the materials from these levels barely differ from those 
of  the Yabrudian (Ronen et al. 2011). In any case the Tabun 
Acheulean is not in accordance with our definitions of  the Le-
vantine Upper Acheulean, hence the position of  the "Tayacian" 
has to be reviewed. In Bezez cave the situation is comparable 
to Tabun with the "Tayacian" predating the Yabrudian. For the 
Shemsian in Jabrud IV chronological evidence is absent. For 
the coastal sites of  Ras Beirut only geomorphological observa-
tions are available, impossible to integrate in an archaeological 
chronology.

This sobering review clearly demonstrates the disparate situation. 
In such a case the term "Tayacian" has merely a descriptive value 
for poorly defined inventories. It is difficult to maintain an inde-
pendent cultural entity on the base of  such inconsistent data.

Conclusions

The Lower Palaeolithic indisputably has a very long and pres-
tigious human history in the Levant. For Syria we are just be-
ginning to get a glimpse of  these periods through the ongoing 
excavations and studies in Hummal and Aïn al Fil, both in the 
geographic heartlands of  the country. The Levantine Lower 
Acheulean, whose beginnings can be placed around one million 
years BP, shows in some areas of  the Levant a clear African 
influence (Gesher Benot Yaacov) that is lacking farther north 
(e.g. Joubb Jenine and Latamne). Geographically the sites of  
the Levantine Lower Acheulean cover a wide range in Syria, en-
compassing a large range of  biotopes, reflecting the high degree 
of  adaptability of  these early hunters and gatherers. It seems 
probable that the arrival of  the Levantine Lower Acheulean 
reflects a new wave of  human immigration into the Eastern 
Mediterranean region. In any case its lithic culture was clearly 
different from its contemporaries in Europe. This separation 
continues all along the subsequent Levantine Upper Acheulean. 
The change between the Lower and Upper Levantine Acheu-
lean perhaps 600 ka ago is substantial, however, it may be a local 

evolution from the regional cultural substratum of  the Lower 
Acheulean. A direct African input is not detectable. To what 
extent the Levantine Upper Acheulean radiated into the Tau-
rus and Caucasian Mountains, or extended to the south, goes 
beyond the scope of  this paper. Especially the Levantine Up-
per Acheulean, with its consistently high percentage of  hand 
axes (fig. 5), perfectly matches the stereotype of  the Acheulean, 
being really rich in hand axes, a cliché that scarcely fits Euro-
pean discoveries where hand axe proportions are consistently 
lower than in the Levant (Jagher 2011). Surprisingly for such a 
remote period, the Levantine Upper Acheulean culture is ex-
tremely versatile, producing a considerable number of  distinct 
chronological facies with a strong persisting cultural identity in 
the background. The observed changes could happen in quite 
a short time as data from Nadaouiyeh Aïn Askar suggest. The 
Levantine Upper Acheulean province is the oldest original cul-
tural entity on the shores of  the Eastern Mediterranean. There 
are no indications of  a new human immigration at the begin-
nings of  the Levantine Upper Acheulean that may have evolved 
locally from the Levantine Lower Acheulean. The end of  the 
Acheulean seems to have come quite fast, for whatever reasons. 
The subsequent "Yabrudian-Mugharan group" is a clear rup-
ture with the long lasting lithic concepts of  the Acheulean. If  
it was an inherent dynamic, or influence from abroad, or the 
immigration of  new human groups, or if  environmental factors 
played a role, is a matter for debate. In any case, in that time 
there occurred several profound changes in lithic traditions as 
débitage replaces façonnage and new technologies with blade 
production appear (Amudian and Pre-Aurignacian). It is chal-
lenging to explain the apparent coexistence of  such different 
traditions within such a small geographic region. Surprisingly 
in that period the obvious difference between Europe and the 
Levant disappeared to a large extent. Any mutual exchange re-
mains to be established yet, despite some congruent develop-
ment (i.e. the Yabrudian-Quina question).

Figure 5 - Comparison of  tool sets during MIS 13-11 (i.e. ~530-375 
ka) in the Levant (black dots) and Europe (grey diamonds). Only sites 
with more than 100 tools are respected.
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